
Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 1

Significant Changes to theSignificant Changes to the

1
Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

International Mechanical Code and 
the

International Fuel Gas Code
2012 Edition

With Louisiana Amendments

Presented by:
Mark Roberts MCP

Copyright Materials

This presentation is protected by US and International 
Copyright laws.  Reproduction, distribution, display and use of 
the presentation without written permission of the speaker is 

prohibited.

© International Code Council 2006

2

PurposePurpose

3
Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

� This program is designed to provide a general overview 
of notable changes that occurred between the 2009 and 
2012 editions of the Mechanical and Fuel Gas (PMG) 
Codes.

� It is intended to acquaint users of the PMG Codes with 
some of those provisions that have been added, 
modified or clarified with the previous edition.

� Only a limited number of changes will be addressed. 

This seminar 
is based on:
This seminar 
is based on:

4
Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

About the Significant ChangesAbout the Significant Changes

5
Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

� Underlined Text has been added.
� “Interior exit stairways and interior exit ramps shall be 

enclosed with fire barriers constructed in accordance with 
Section 706.” 

� Lined-out text has been deleted.
� “Elevator lobbies shall have at least one means of egress 

complying with Chapter 10 and other provisions within this 
code.”

2012 International Mechanical 
Code Significant Changes
2012 International Mechanical 
Code Significant Changes

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 6Page 72



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 2

102.3 Maintenance102.3 Maintenance

� Modified: 
ASHRAE/ACCA/ANSI 
Standard 180 is now 
specified for the 
inspection for 
maintenance of the 
HVAC system. 

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

7Page 74

202 Environmental Air202 Environmental Air

� Clarified: The definition of environmental air has 
been expanded through the addition of parking 
garage exhaust.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

8

Parking 
garage

Page 75

306.5 Equipment and Appliances 
on Roofs or Elevated Structures
306.5 Equipment and Appliances 
on Roofs or Elevated Structures
� Modified: It has been clarified that 

permanent access is required to 
equipment and appliances on a roof or 
elevated structure higher than 16 feet 
above grade, and required clearances are 
now provided to assure access to ladders 
required for access to roofs or elevated 
structures.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 9Page 76

Roof accessRoof access

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 10Page 76

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 11

Access 
ladder
Access 
ladder

Page 77

308.5 Labeled Assemblies308.5 Labeled Assemblies

� Modified: Allowable 
clearance reductions 
must now be based on 
listed and labeled 
reduced-clearance 
protective assemblies 
in accordance with UL 
1618. 

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 12

Listed and labeled clearance 
protection assembly 
(Courtesy of Northwest Stoves)

Page 79



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 3

401.4 Intake Opening Location401.4 Intake Opening Location

� Modified: The minimum clearance between an 
air intake opening and any public way is now 
measured from the opening to the lot line, not to 
the centerline of the public way.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

13

Air intake locations

Page 80

Table 403.3 Minimum Ventilation 
Rates for Nail Salons
Table 403.3 Minimum Ventilation 
Rates for Nail Salons
� Modified: Nail 

stations in nail 
salons must now 
each be provided 
with a source 
capture system.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

14

Nail salon station

Page 82

Significant Changes to the International Plumbing, 
Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 15

Occupancy 
Classification

People Outdoor 
Airflow Rate In 
Breathing Zone 
RpCFM/Person 
Occupant Density 
#/1000 ft 2a

Area Outdoor  
Airflow Rate In 
Breathing Zone 
RaCFM/FT2a People 
Outdoor Airflow 
Rate In Breathing 
Zone 
RpCFM/Person

Default Occupant 
Density 
#/1000 ft2a

Area Outdoor 
Airflow Rate In 
Breathing Zone 
RaCFM/FT2a

Exhaust Airflow 
Rate CFM/FT2a

Beauty and nail
salons b,h 20 0.12 25  0.6  

Nail Salonsb,h 25 20 0.12 0.6

TABLE 403.3  Minimum Ventilation Rates

e.  Rates are per water closet or urinal. The higher rate shall be provided where periods of heavy use  are  expected to 
occur, such as, toilets in theaters, schools, and sports facilities. The lower rate shall be permitted where periods of heavy
use are not expected. The higher rate shall be provided where the exhaust system is designed to operate intermittently. 
The lower rate shall be permitted only where the exhaust system is designed to operate continuously while occupied.

f. Rates are per room unless otherwise indicated. The higher rate shall be provided where the exhaust system is 
designed to operate intermittently. The lower rate shall be permitted only where the exhaust system is designed to 
operate continuously while occupied normal hours of use.

h. For nail salons, the required exhaust shall include ventilation tables or other systems that capture the 
contaminants and odors at their source and are capable of exhausting a minimum of 50 cfm per station each nail station 
shall be provided with a source capture system capable of exhausting not less than 50 cfm per station.

Page 82

404.1 Enclosed Parking Garages404.1 Enclosed Parking Garages

� Modified: The 
mechanical ventilation 
systems required in 
enclosed parking 
garages are now 
permitted to be operated 
automatically by carbon 
monoxide detectors.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 16

Carbon monoxide detector 
(Courtesy of Brasch Manufacturing Co.)

Page 83

501.2, 506.4 Independent 
Exhaust Systems Required
501.2, 506.4 Independent 
Exhaust Systems Required
� Modified: Those locations where an 

independent exhaust system is required are now 
established in a single code provision.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 17

Independent 
exhaust 
system

Page 84

505.1 Domestic Kitchen Exhaust 
Systems
505.1 Domestic Kitchen Exhaust 
Systems
� Modified: Domestic kitchen exhaust ducts 

are now required to be independent of all 
other exhaust systems.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 18

Independent 
domestic 
exhaust 
system

Page 84



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 4

506.3.7.1 Grease Reservoirs506.3.7.1 Grease Reservoirs

� Added: Criteria provided for the 
construction of a grease reservoir in a 
grease duct system where the reservoir is 
not a manufactured product.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

19

Grease 
reservoir

Page 86

506.3.8 Grease Duct Cleanouts 
and Other Openings 
506.3.8 Grease Duct Cleanouts 
and Other Openings 
� In addition to the reformatting of previous 

criteria for grease duct cleanouts, gasket 
and sealing materials on grease duct 
cleanout doors must now be rated at a 
minimum of 1500°F.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

20Page 87

Grease duct cleanout 
opening
Grease duct cleanout 
opening

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 21Page 87

506.3.9 Grease Duct Horizontal 
Cleanouts
506.3.9 Grease Duct Horizontal 
Cleanouts
� Modified: Criteria for cleanouts serving horizontal 

grease ducts have been rearranged for ease of 
use and clarification, and several technical 
provisions have been added or modified.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 22

Horizontal 
grease 
duct 
cleanout 
opening

Page 89

506.3.10 Underground Grease 
Duct Installations
506.3.10 Underground Grease 
Duct Installations
� Addition: Grease ducts installed in underground 

locations are now regulated based upon a 
number of new provisions.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 23

Underground 
grease duct

Page 90

506.3.11.2 Field-Applied Grease 
Duct Enclosures
506.3.11.2 Field-Applied Grease 
Duct Enclosures
� Clarified: Field-applied grease duct enclosure 

systems are now specifically prohibited from 
being used to reduce clearance to combustibles. 

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 24

Grease 
duct 
clearance

Page 92



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 5

507.2 Type I or Type II Hood 
Required 
507.2 Type I or Type II Hood 
Required 
� Modified: A 

Type I or Type 
II commercial 
kitchen hood is 
not required for 
appliances with 
listed integral 
downdraft 
exhaust 
systems.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

25

Hibachi table with integral downdraft exhaust system 
(Courtesy of Roaster Tech)

Page 93

507.2.1 Type I Hoods507.2.1 Type I Hoods

� Modified: Type I hoods no longer are 
required to be installed where complying 
electric cooking appliances are being 
used.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

26

Electric oven where 
a hood is not 
required (Courtesy 
of TurboChef
Global)

Page 94

507.2.1.1 Operation of Type I 
Hoods 
507.2.1.1 Operation of Type I 
Hoods 
� Modified: A method is now required to 

keep the pilot burner on a gas cooking 
appliance from being extinguished when 
the kitchen exhaust fan interlock shuts off 
appliances.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 27Page 95

Commercial cooking appliance 
vented by exhaust hoods
Commercial cooking appliance 
vented by exhaust hoods

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 28Page 95

507.2.1.2 Exhaust Flow Rate 
Label for Type I Hoods
507.2.1.2 Exhaust Flow Rate 
Label for Type I Hoods
� Added: Manufacturers of 

listed Type I commercial 
cooking hoods are now 
required to provide 
information on a label 
attached to the hood 
specifying the listed 
minimum exhaust air flow for 
the hood based upon the 
cooking appliance duty 
classification.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 29

Type I hood label

Page 97

507.2.2 Type II Hoods507.2.2 Type II Hoods

� Modified: A Type II hood 
is now required to be 
installed above all 
appliances that produce 
products of combustion but 
do no produce grease or 
smoke. An exact exhaust 
rate is specified for areas 
where a cooking appliance 
is being used but a Type II 
hood is not required.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 30

Cooking appliance that does not 
require a Type II hood

Page 98



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 6

507.10 Hoods Penetrating a 
Ceiling
507.10 Hoods Penetrating a 
Ceiling
� Added: Field-applied grease duct enclosure 

systems are now specifically prohibited from 
being used as enclosures over the top of Type I 
hoods.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

31

Hood 
enclosure

Page 99

601.4 Contamination Prevention 
in Plenums
601.4 Contamination Prevention 
in Plenums
� Modified: Chimneys and vents are now 

permitted to pass through a plenum where 
in compliance with one of three new 
allowances.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

32Page 101

Chimney or vent in a plenumChimney or vent in a plenum

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 33Page 101

602.2.1 Materials within Plenums602.2.1 Materials within Plenums

� Clarified: It has been clarified that any 
material or assembly that encloses a 
combustible material in a plenum must be 
noncombustible, gypsum board or listed 
and labeled as part of a tested assembly 
or system.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 34Page 103

Material within a plenumMaterial within a plenum

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 35Page 103

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 36Page 104



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 7

Louisiana AmendmentLouisiana Amendment

� 603.4 Metallic ducts. All metallic ducts 
shall be constructed as specified in the 
SMACNA HVAC Duct Construction 
Standards-Metal and Flexible. 
� Exception: Ducts installed within single 

dwelling units shall have a minimum 
thickness as specified in the 2006 
International Mechanical Code Table 
603.4.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

37

Louisiana AmendmentLouisiana Amendment

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

38

Louisiana AmendmentLouisiana Amendment

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 39

603.7 Rigid Duct Penetrations603.7 Rigid Duct Penetrations

� Modified: In relationship to the required 
garage/dwelling separation, only those 
ducts that penetrate a wall or ceiling 
between the dwelling and the adjacent 
private garage need comply with Section 
603.7.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 40Page 105

Duct penetration of a 
garage/dwelling separation
Duct penetration of a 
garage/dwelling separation

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 41Page 105

603.9 Duct Joints, Seams, and 
Connections
603.9 Duct Joints, Seams, and 
Connections
� Clarified: Unlisted 

duct tape is not 
longer permitted as 
a sealant on 
nonmetallic ducts.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 42

Listed duct tape (Courtesy of 
Venture Tape)

Page 106



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 8

603.17, 202 Air Dispersion 
Systems
603.17, 202 Air Dispersion 
Systems
� Added: Air dispersion systems as defined 

in Section 202 and recognized in UL 2518 
are now permitted to be installed.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

43Page 107

Louisiana AmendmentLouisiana Amendment

� 606.4.1 Supervision. The duct smoke 
detectors shall be connected to a fire 
alarm system where a fire alarm system is 
required by Section 907.2 of the 
International Fire Code or locally 
adopted fire code. The actuation of a 
duct smoke detector shall activate a visible 
and audible supervisory signal at a 
constantly attended location. 

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

44

Air dispersion ductAir dispersion duct

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 45Page 107

805.3 Factory-Built Chimney 
Offsets
805.3 Factory-Built Chimney 
Offsets
� Added: The maximum offset in a factory-

built chimney is now specified and the 
number of offsets has been limited.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 46

Factory-built 
chimney offset

Page 108

901.4 Fireplace Accessories901.4 Fireplace Accessories

� Added: Fireplace accessories must now 
comply with UL 907, which has been 
added to Chapter 15.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 47

Listed outside 
air intake 
regulator for 
masonry 
fireplace

Page 109

1101.10 Locking Access Port 
Caps
1101.10 Locking Access Port 
Caps
� Modified: Locking caps are no longer 

required on refrigerant access ports if the 
refrigeration equipment is located in a 
secured location.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 48Page 111



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 9

Air-
conditioning 
unit in a 
secured 
location

Air-
conditioning 
unit in a 
secured 
location

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

49Page 111

2012 International Fuel Gas 
Code Significant Changes
2012 International Fuel Gas 
Code Significant Changes

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 50Page 114

202, 401.9, 401.10, 404.1 
Identification, Testing and 
Certification

202, 401.9, 401.10, 404.1 
Identification, Testing and 
Certification

� Addition: Each 
section of pipe 
and each fitting 
utilized in a gas 
system requires 
the identification 
of the 
manufacturer.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 51Page 116

308.1 Clearance to Combustible 
Materials 
308.1 Clearance to Combustible 
Materials 
� Clarified: It has been clarified that 

gypsum board is to be considered a 
combustible material for the purpose of 
required clearances, including those 
provisions of Section 308 addressing 
reductions in required clearances.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 52Page 117

Clearance 
to gypsum 
wallboard

Clearance 
to gypsum 
wallboard

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 53

Page 117

404.2 CSST Piping Systems404.2 CSST Piping Systems

� Addition: CSST piping systems shall be 
installed in accordance with their listing 
and the manufacturer’s installation 
instructions.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 54Page 118



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 10

Sample installation instructions for 
CSST gas piping
Sample installation instructions for 
CSST gas piping

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical and 
Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

55Page 118

404.18 Prohibited Devices404.18 Prohibited Devices

� Clarification: Excess flow valves and 
similar devices are now permitted to be 
placed in gas piping systems that have 
been sized to accommodate the pressure 
drop.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition

56

Listed excess flow valve

Page 119

408.4 Sediment 
Traps
408.4 Sediment 
Traps
� Modification: An 

illustration of a 
sediment trap is now 
included within the 
IFGC in order to clarify 
the intent of the 
provisions.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 57Page 120

410.4 Excess Flow Valves410.4 Excess Flow Valves

� Addition: An 
excess flow valve 
must now be listed, 
sized, and installed 
in accordance with 
the manufacturer’s 
instructions.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 58Page 121

Listed excessive flow valve

202, 410.5 Flashback Arrestor 
Check Valve
202, 410.5 Flashback Arrestor 
Check Valve
� Addition: A 

combination 
flashback arrestor 
and backflow 
check valve is now 
required on any 
fuel gas system 
used with oxygen 
in any hot work 
operations.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 59

Check valve and flash arrestor

Page 122

618.4 Prohibited Sources618.4 Prohibited Sources

� Modification: 
Return air may 
be taken from a 
garage 
provided with a 
dedicated 
forced-air 
system.

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 60

Furnace serving a garage

Page 123



Significant Changes to the International 

Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas Codes, 

2012 Edition

10/19/2015

Copyright 2011 International Code Council 11

Thank You!Thank You!

Questions?
Contact me at:
Mark Roberts CBO, MCP, ECS

Senior Regional Manager 
Serving; AL, LA, MS & TN
1-888-422-7233 X7265
mroberts@iccsafe.org
iccsafe.org

Significant Changes to the International Mechanical 
and Fuel Gas Codes, 2012 Edition 61

Copyright Materials

This presentation is protected by US and International 
Copyright laws.  Reproduction, distribution, display and use of 
the presentation without written permission of the speaker is 

prohibited.

© International Code Council 2006

62


